YR PAGE 1 Thursday, October 09, 2025 DRF HARNESS EYE YR PAGE 1

YONKERS THU 1 Mile Pace. CLAIMING ALLOWANCE $25,000. Purse $17,000 PP 6:45 pm
S1 PICK 4 (1-2-3-4) | $2 DAILY DOUBLE (1-2) | $2 EXACTA | $2 TRIPLE | $.10 SUPERFECTA

ROCKIN N TALKIN(L) 9, by Custard The Dragon, Shes Just Rockin by Rocknroll Hanover Last5Sts-§7,150  *1:53.2YR ZYRT6 3 3 1 46102T0t2 332 SR
51:49.1 (718) $2,385 $25,000 V\o%n temet Stable LLC,Piscataway,NJ:Stration Stable Inc. Goshen NY-Carolvn A Mac Isaac.ON 1:521 YR g‘s‘x 15 g g a vazlf%e -1%22 s‘é zg zg sﬁ?ﬂ;ﬁ
4-1 J. Stratton 1371-196-200-202 (143) C. Stratton 781- 120 130-124(.164) Br.- Surdale Farms Ltd Kelowna,Bc-Allan B Neuraut -S4,
MSpB  TYR 1720 272 5731261 1:55 25000cim 17000 4 575 7% 78 5% JoSatn ~ CoStratn 29 30 281 283 1:55¢ 83 +34w  L*1.10 BumhmBoy ChntBIckHuk, Shid rafcIn o bio8
155025 QYR fst73° 28 :5721:252 1:53¢ 30000ci 18000 8 8‘2 g1s g0 g g9 JMarhndr  MeScran 302 293 272 282 1554 83 476w L7066 SaddeUp CutNRunN SthPetyr Traldai o ic8
8Sp2%  BYR fst67° 27 :55¢1:233 1:52¢ 30000ckm 18000 8 818 gl0 78 78 54 CoKelly MeScran 293 281 272 282 1:533 94 475w L6231 SaddeUpGdsThundrAlexTye Sat bokang I stoy-8
1925  2YR fst72° 274 :57 1:251 1:54 30000cm 18000 1 22 2% 22 1 ) CoKelly MeScran 281 291 281 282 1:54 92 454w L165 SdUpReknNTknShawCt Pk frafc In ang pace-7
BAgs  TYR fst79° 271 1562 1:044 1:503 30000 18000 6 6% 6 6% 6% 59 Palachanc MeScran 291 29 274 282 1:542 90 +56w 129,00 RgngDStPyyrhvnOnUp Sat bifand out o bid-7
18Aug25  BYR fst72° 273 :5731:26 1:543 30000ckm 18000 3 564 56 545 535 4% Palachanc MeScran 284 30 28 281 1:55 87 +64w  L5.00 ScdiUpBrbckipWhyTmmA Sat.ang In rafc, pace-8
4hugls YR fst83° 27 1562 1:244 1:532 30000cim 18000 4 54 55 44 42 Ink Cokely ~ MeScran 274 293 281 274 1:532 95 +57w  L6.10 ReknNThaWhyTommRStPetyr Ral2nd o1 salely-7
BJy%5  2YR fst9 27 5621981 {54 aoooomm 18000 2 46 455 48 455 3} CoKelly  MeScran 281 291 282 284 1:543 89 +72é1w 352‘070 S;hP:lychkggg&wunghmBovw . ;nsgje‘anggf&g
KARLOO BRADLEY N(L) 9, by Sweet Lou, Supreme Brigade by Bettor's Delight Last5Sts-§9,040  1:534 YR . . 3
71:532 83219 $25,000 Ant ony N Ventrigio Manalapan NJ 1:532 YR ggng ? i ? $54830 24Tot 26 3 3 5 830
20-1 A. Siegelman 1135-83-123-146 (073) A. Adamczyk 362- 65 52- 56( 180) Br.- Woodlands Stud Nz Inc,NZ SUpA0Life MO0 515 42349
%802 10YR fst73° 275 :554 1:244 1:55 c25000cim 17000 7 g6y g6 g JoStrattin -~ CoStratin 291 28 284 301 1567 81 +05n L3239 WanfTDelghDublexTye St b ang nno i
15525 9YR fst73° 28 :5721:252 1:53¢ 30000ck 18000 1 2“2 21‘2 W2 4 JoStratin -~ CoStrattn 281 292 281 281 154 92 +76w L1286 SaddleUpCutNRunN SthPetyr Pitbord n lane-3
4Sep5 YR fst72° 281 :5721:261 1:543 ¢25000ckm 17000 3 21 o1 9% 91) ohd AuSiegimn  MiForte 282 291 284 281 1:543 89 +250w  L3.40 BumhmBoy KrloBrdly Dontelmnw Pkt ang n pace-8
%8Aug25 YR fst7® 274 :5711:26 1543 c25000ckm 17000 4 12 4% ! fhd  pno JoStrattn ~~ CoStrattn 274 292 284 283 1:543 91 23w L1.85 OnDaybooKroBrdlyBmhmBy Ldduginf beat§
21Aug2s  BYR  fst69° 274 :5641:253 1:543 c25000ckm 17000 8 3% 33 58 521 77 BrHolland  JeDrolet 28 292 28¢ 294 156 82 +14w L4625 BumhmBoyBlackHwkJDontelmnw  Piishfidnobid8
f1Augs YR fst83° 271 :5611:25 1:54 30000ci 18000 8 78 791 764 76} 76% AuSiegnn ~ JeDrolet 284 291 281 291 1:552 85 +54w L4750 IDranihsnSaibtHnvAXTy Sat ang st m,no bic8
2Mg%  2YR fSt7S° 28 5741:06 1:55 625000k 17000 1 1% 115 1} 14 nk AuSiegimn  MiForte 28 29% 28129 1:55 89 +05w  L1.85 KrioBrdyGdsThunciimphsinse Ld,dug n safely-8
%BJy5 QYR fstB0° 73 5621244 1:54 c25000c 17000 5 56 593 533 6% §74 AuSiealmn _JoGodinez 284 283 281 294 1552 85 36w L1.95 SaibtnvHrknkngHohOnRck Off paceralno bid 8
HIGH ON ROCKNROLL (L) Chg\G |-t|J¥ NO%HUII Eigh Kiél HKitty Bang by Rocknroll Hanover Last 5 Sts-$2,720 }gg;”\‘m R e gg% optE e %%
201 MaMI\llsazc2 Zl?\éslhzggmw 40 (041) szs(mDarlf;teiggns%r?gmg%e%( 140) Br.- Donald E Robinson & Robert A Mondillo,OH BYRH 034 $HBALife 10101721 $IB7N
ASepds  TYR fst72° 272 :5731:961 1:55 25000cm 17000 2 3% 383 5%% 55 74 MaMacDnld DeJlaterz 281 301 283 28¢ 1:55¢ 83 +34w L4042 BumhmBoy ChanteeBlackHuik) Ralshfdnobid8
N%ep%  2YR fs[eaf’ 283 :58¢1:272 1:551 25000cim 17000 5 67F 655 6% 640 45} MaMacDnld  DeJLaterz 301 293 28% 27¢ 15561 81 -1 2w L49.05 BumhmBoyimThePceOnDayboo Rode ralno bid-8
11Sep25  BYR fst74° 272 :5721:262 1:554 25000cim 17000 1 38 38F 433 53 723 MaMacDnld Dellaterz 28 30 29 292 1:562 80 16w  L77.02 HrknkngiMdindBsBmhmBy Shflang Inric,n0 bid-8
4Sep25  BYR fst72° 281 :5721:061 1:543 25000cm 17000 7 8" g0 g6 g5} 763 MaMacDnld  DeJlaterz 302 29 28 283 156 82 +25w  L49.30 BumhmBoyKroBrdlyDontelmmy Traldailno ic8
BAUGS  BYR fst7™ 274 :5711:26 1:543 25000cim 17000 1 3% 387 32 3% 4% MaMacDnld DeJlaterz 283 291 283 283 1555 87 23w  L48.25 OnDaybooKrloBrlyBinhmBy Satroom railno bid-8
AAugd  8YR fst69° 274 564 1:253 1:543 25000cm 17000 5 77 79 6°%%F g4 %% StSmith Dedlaterz 291 292 281 291 156 83 +14w  L47.25 BmhmByBlckHwkJDnimw Sat bk outéin o bid8
9Augs  6YR fsto0° 272 :5721:252 1:542 25000cm 17000 4 59 56 435 44 48 StSmith Dedlaterz 291 292 272 292 1:552 85 +23w L3250 BetrbckipHpnriHevnChetHnv Inside,ang Inno bic-8
2Aug25 YR fst78° 28 574196 1:55 25000ckm 17000 4 443 g4 g4l §23 483 SiSmith Dedlaterz 984 204 281 98¢ 1553 84 40 ZgWYR ng1‘735 Ksr\o%rd\yadggﬁnggﬁm% ; Eﬂzan,shﬂdggsbgjs.g
BETTORBUCKLEUP(L) b g 8, by Bettor's Delight, Farouche Hanover by McArdle Last5Sts-§5,350  1:541YR ! ot I
41:49.1 (7/8) $2,202 $25,000 Thomas Ceraso Jr Stamford,C ("% 1:57.2 YR 24 x« 4100 960024 4100 000
8-1 B. Holland 1334-189-199-196 (142) P. Stafford 359-36- 48 -39(.100) B - Jeff C Mcfadden,Chatharm-Jeff S Roberts Manot BWRZ IS 1T lfe WTBT K2
%Sep25  10YR fst73° 273 :55¢1:044 1555 25000 17000 1 43 4ipdh 42} 75 JMarhndr  PaStaffrd 281 281 29 303 156 82 <050 1928 WarRTiDelghiDuAlexTye Rode ralo bid-8
17825 YR fst69° 273 :564 1:251 1:533 25000ck 17000 5 66 63 6% 54 5 MaKakaley ~PeStaffrd 284 292 28 28 1:541 91 +35w L1388 MaximsRedDelghiDuChantee Off pace 2l no bid8
8%p25  5YR fst67° 27 :55¢1:233 1:524 30000ckn 18000 5 573 56 563 56F 74 JMarhndr PaStafird 282 283 28 283 1:533 94 475w 12943 SaddeUpGasThundrAlexTye Off pace 2l no bid8
BAuges YR Tst79° 271 1562 1:244 1523 30000cm 18000 7 ym 7 78, 712 715 BrHolland ~ PaStaffrd 292 291 27¢ 291 1:553 84 456w 13500 ReigngDeoSthPetyrhlovinOnUp Traidraino factor-7
1BAug25  BYR  fst72° 275 2575 1:26 1:543 30000ci 18000 2 3% 3% %% o 9 BrHolland  PaStaffid 281 30 28 282 1:54% 93 464w 1680 SadUpBrbckiphhyTimiR 3hole 2w b 314 sty 8
9Aug25  6YR fst90° 272 :5721:252 1:542 25000ckn 17000 1 4% 415 4% 45 13} BrHolland  PeStafrd 272 30 28 29 1:542 92 +23w  L1.55 Beirboklp HpnrHenn Chethiny Ldwon handily-8
By 2YR SO 27 562 1:251 1:54  30000cm o0 7 g gy g8 g% 7n BrHolland  PaStaffrd 293 292 274 292 1:561 81 +74w L5300 StPetyrRcknNTknBurnhmBoy Trald oo fact 8
I7Juy25  BYR fst88° 28 575196 1541 25000cim 17000 3 4% 4% 41 13 BrHolland  PaStaffrd 28 293 282 081 1:541 93 416w  L2.75 Betiockip SmootiLou Osirotinv Led,won handily-7
I731ligl'\;1l;lH$i\1lg\lsl BOY N(L) . é;dgAbygettoLs Dﬁhght Tinisha Franco by Holmes Hanover Last 5 Sts-$29,580 }ggﬂg %ivﬁ }g ; ; g &% ;5‘_'_0: }g ; ; g ﬁ%
* 00d's Auto,Canonsbura, :93. 3
9-5 G. Brennan 1391-208-217-193 (150) " D. Daguet 278 42- 36 31( 151) Br.- A Thomson AS B «1K 321 rdlife BTN WAL
A%p25  TYR Tst72° 272 :5731:261 1:55 25000cn 17000 1% 1) 13 Ink GeBrennan  DeDaguet 272 301 283 28¢ 1:55 89 +34w  L2.96 BumnfmBoyChanteeBlackHukJ Lddug in gamely-8
NSep25  2YR  fst68° 283 :5841:072 1:551 25000 17000 w 1“2 ISR L B GeBrennan  DeDaguet  28% 301 283 274 1551 88 12y L»49 BumhmBoy ImThePceOnDyb Ld welatd safely-8
MSep25  BYR fst74° 272 :5721:262 1:554 25000cim 17000 5 1°% 1% 4% 1 3nk JaBarttt  DeDaguet 272 30 29 292 1:554 85 18w  L*23 HiknkngMalnoBsBrhmBy  Usd pst 14/duf beat8
4%eps  5YR fst72° 281 :5721:2611:543 25000ckm 17000 8 4% %% 113 {1} hd JaBartltt DeDaguet 281 291 284 282 1:543 91 +25¢  L2.90 BumhmBoyKrloBrdlyDontelmnw Led dug n safely-8
BAUGS  BYR fst7 274 :5711:26 1:543 25000cm 17000 7 68 68 635 623 3 AuSieglmn ~ DeDaguet 293 291 274 281 1:54¢ 88 23w 12020 OnDybKrlBrdlyBrhmBy Satang I pace tc 18
oAigs  8YR fst69° 274 :56412531543 25000cim 17000 6 5% 58 4°2h 3} 3 JaBarttt ~ DeDaguet  28% 292 28 283 1:543 90 +14w  L3.20 BrohmByBlckHwk.Dntmnw Crang st im safely-8
13Augs  2YR  fst8O° 272 :56 1:24 1:53¢ 30000 20000 3 45 4% 44 52} 51} DaDube ~ DeDaguet 282 283 274 291 154 92 +65w  L23.30 SkDegresSthPetyBlackHuk) Rail2nd ov,afc In7
dhugde  1YR fst83° 27 562 1:044 1:532 30000ckm 18000 6 3°%h 3°2 g% 753 78} DaDube  DeDaguet 271 293 284 292 1555 92 457w L60.25 ReknNThnWhyTmrRShPyr Speed,parkd outrd-7
?E;_IfzI;OTFUL DUDE N(L) $250005)gg by Be&tors#ﬁllght Dudinka's Angel by Christian Cullen Last 5 Sts-$33,000 *11;:5;31.2P;r:5l8 gix %g ‘14 g g ﬁ% gﬂgt % ; g g ;sgom
lose Cervantes, Nazare 9. & 3
92 Co. Kelly tgss041- 70(124) M. Ruiz 119-13-13- 15( 109) Br- G Chin,NZ BYR3B 576 $I1BE0LIfe 133241921 $334294
25Sep25  10YR fst73° 273 :55¢1:244 1:55 ¢25000ckm 17000 3 ohd 13 13 2Nk BrHolland  Dellaterz 273 281 29 301 1:55 87 +05w  L*1.43 WarFTrDelghiDuAlexTye Ld,prkd foe tuf beat-8
7%p2%  1YR  fstéo° 273 564 1:251 1:533 ¢25000cim 17000 1 1“ L L S ohd TyButer JaBako 973 291 282 282 {:533 96 +35w  L*73 MaximsRed DelghtDu Cnantee Ld,gameuf beat-8
10825 6YR fst70° 28 574 1:262 1:551 c25000ckm 17000 1 f°no 413 4143 13 GeBrennan  DeDaguet 28 294 283 284 15557 88 +25w  L*1.95 DightDNhmsRdBlckHuk/ Pt d pst 11 sefely7
NAugD YR fst7r 281 :5811:262 1:543 25000cm 17000 4 12 12 12y 12 113 GeBrennan  DeDaguet 281 30 28! 28" 1:543 91 +14w  Lx.15 DelghtDuMaximsRedToTheHunt Ledwon handily-7
Bhg YR fst70° 274 57‘12521:543020000 15000 8 1°T 1% 125 18 131 GeBrennan AnAdmezyk 274 292 281 291 1:543 91 16w L4.00 DeighDuTinRoiRarBilHaley Usd 114 dhandy 8
1BAug5 YR fst7e° 073 157 1:244 1:532 20000 15000 1 4% 13 445 155 18} GeBrennan DeDaguet 273 292 274 283 1:532 97 +1 5w  L*1.75 DelghiDuBillHaley HoosirClb Ldwon handily-8
%Jiy5 YR fst80° 274 :57u25aw;55w €20000 15000 4 56 4°8%F 42} 42% 2} AuSiegmn  LaHudson 29 292 273 292 1:552 87 36w L990 HoosiCloDelghtDuDrnimnw Cur Bl pace-8
19Juy?5  8YR fst78° 274 :5731:98 1:551 20000 15000 7 7™M 79 E4R 54 42 AuSiegimn _ LaHudson 30 992 973 983 1:553 84 -QZSWYR LZ;aaoo DsmgnThBHsaaw mf\/\zrg%[}smsﬂ DOﬁSpacze‘anglg;iez-;
CHANTEE(L) b g7, by Shadow Play, Intense by Shanghai Phil Last 5 Sts-$7,940 ot g
61:51.4 1,152 $25,000 Briangra Wallach Racing,Closter,NJ *1:51.4 YR AYR14 232 SBH0OATot2 3 55 4477
7-2 J. Bartlett 1273-420-226-170 (330) J. Bako 311-59-54- 30 190) Br.- Guy Corbell Mirabel,Qc B 3664 SRISOLfe 1B192619 29302
ASepd  TYR fst72° 272 15731261 1555 ¢25000ckm 17000 3 é 453 2% 2h ok Palachanc Palachanc 283 301 272 28 1:55 91 +34w 546 BumhmBoyChniBlckHuk) Tstup,palduf beat-8
17525 YR fst69° 273 :564 1:051 1:533 25000ck 17000 2 2“2 Moo 2 3 Palachanc Palachanc 274 291 282 281 1:533 94 +35w 1532 MaximsRed DelghtDu Chantee Pitang In pace8
10%p% YR fst70° 273 :565 1:244 1:532 NW5000 14000 5 65 67 655 684 5O Palachanc Palachanc 284 291 28 283 1:543 89 +25w  L6.26 TheGrkFriCurdBragePoplt Sat bk ang Inno bic8
1%p2%  10YR fst72° 28 :58 1.6 1:543 NW7500L5 16000 3 45 44 6°4%F 65 75 Palachanc Palachanc 29 29¢ 28! 283 15553 85 +54w  L565 SwihmlomLevine Poplt Shi 3 o0 bio-8
Bhugs YR fst79° 273 :5711:05 15531 NWi2351L5 19000 6 6% 68  §5h 58 5O Palachanc Palachanc 292 292 271 281 1:541 91 +56w L7450 PoeOutPseKngsvWknshuN e bkouingo ks
12Mus  3YR fst83° 274 :5721:053 1:534 NW10000 19000 3 44 44 %% ! 33 DaDube  Palachanc 283 293 278 28 1:53¢ 97 +33w  L6.30 TheldiDnc Laytontnv Chnt Tstupgrind sty In8
5Aug25  TYR fst78° 28 :5711:243 1:524 NW11321L5 19000 7 7° 79, 78 675 654 Palachanc Palachanc 294 291 271 274 1:54 92 +67w L6275 LousWorldAmmWhtsStnl Sat rafc Inang,no bid-8
0025 9YR fst9™° 273 :5711:244 1:504 NW0OW 19000 3 45 44 4% 43%  47) Palachanc Palachanc 283 292 274 282 {:541 91 +9zéwYR ;;2410 wqhéHawkhggﬂggngruTﬂvm% s Rm%&g
MOVIN ON UP(L) b g 10, by Bettor's Delight, Green Space by Artsplace Last5Sts-$2,160  *1:53:2 YR ot
71:49.1 (5/8) $925 $25,000 Stacia D & Greaony Taylor Haines City L 1:53.2 YR gngﬁ g g g $3&4ng$01 2%2 32 3%42 *%0,%
0-1 Ty. Buter 13- 55450 (129 P. Blumenfeld 359 16 28- 38( 045) Br.- Dunroven Stud LLC.KY $0Life #3630,
27Sep25y TYR fst72° 272 :5791:061 1:55 25000cm 17000 8°63 g75 8% AuSiegimn ~ PBlumnfld 30 294 274 282 1:56 83 +34w L4402 BumhmBoy ChtBlckHwkJ Trald 4h ovno bid-8
78ep25 YR fst69° 273 :56¢1:251 1:533 25000cim 17000 8 89 89% g8 771 7% AuSiegimn ~ PBlumnfld 292 292 28 283 1:552 85 +35w L6328 MaximsRed DeighiDu Chantee Tredaino factr-8
10825 6YR fst70° 28 :57412621551 25000cim 17000 6 66 673 55 6% 62} AuSiegimn ~ PBlumnfid 291 30 28! 281 1:553 84 +25w L4286 DelghiDulhmsRdBlckHukJ Sat bk ang Inpace-7
1%p2%  2YR fst72° 274 :57 1:051 1:54 30000cm 18000 6 684 684 682 %% 6%} AuSieglmn ~ PBlumnfld 292 291 274 281 1:543 89 454w L1635 SaddeUpRekaNThkn ShdCt Sat bk ail o bid-7
%Aug2s YR fst79° 271 1562 1:244 1:523 30000cim 18000 3 2% 213 32 5%% 36} AuSiegimn ~ PBlumnfld 273 29 283 28% 1:534 93 456w 1660 ReigngDeoSinPetyrbiviOnUp Shflfand out.no bid-7
16AIgS 2R gd79° 264 553 1:242 1532 25000cm 17000 6 2% 2l %% 23 AuSiegimn  PBlumnfid 27 28% 284 284 1:532 100 +15w  L36.25 MnOnUpCoiHnvSpndctny Pt outkinang Inhndy-6
10Augzs 1PcD fst85° 27 :5611:231 1:51 NW4900L4 8500 4 43 43%  48% 45 5% CoKelly ~ PBlumnfid 274 291 264 28 1514 95 +84w L2980 GntleGint Lyonshusc Boots Noraly6
1hugs _ 4YR fst72° 282 :58¢1:972 1:552 NWG4BELS 14000 5 584 574 5°8 48} 4% MaMacDnld PBlumnfld 293 304 278 28 156 83 +15u L4050 RolgWihSOpclisnNDirsTim 2nd ov gapd.no bid-8

(L) TREATED WITH LASIX
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2 YONKERS THU 1 Mile Pace. F&M CLAIMING ALLOWANCE $20,000. Purse $15,000
2ND HALF DAILY DOUBLE | $2 EXACTA | $2 TRIPLE | $.10 SUPERFECTA | $1 PICK 3 (2-3-4)
EMDOUBLEAKAY (L) br m 5, by Jk Endofanera, Myrichmothernlaw by Well Said Last 5 Sts- 1:53 Har BHYR 041 §1B82025Tot29 652 57719
F1524 (71) 2682 24000 Rodre Lo Saou 0. / LSSSED 2 4Hop7s 2R 0000 -ATot0 3 12
7-2 Co. Kelly 45-50:1- 70(124) A. Adamczyk 362-65-52- 56%180) Br.- John L Miller, N BZYROO0O0O -Life 1051210 7 $15884
10ct25  1YR fst63 " 271 57 1251 1:534 FM20000CLM 15000 2 56 , 4 223 ino 2% CoKelly AnAdmezyk 282 293 272 283 1:54 97 16w L1955 DstntlviEmdblyFghiNifi stup,rebufd ol 2nd8
2%p2%5  11YR fst?SD 27 :563125 1:554 FM2000OCLM 15000 7 89} 884 805‘2 78 2 CoKelly AnAdmezyk 29 292 282 291 1:56 83 463w  L60.12 SaleEISolEmdoublkyQckMn 4th ov fand out pace-8
16525 YR fst69° 274 :5711:26 1:553 FM20OOOCLM 15000 7 795 793  6°4h 43 63} CoKelly — AnAdmczyk 298 298 273 292 1567 82 +36w L2250 DefngthhQekMnlitKs Off pace,2nd ov,n0 bioS
6Sp2%  6YR gd76° 282 :584127 1561 FM2000OCLM 15000 7 794 79 7°6L  g7F 6% CoKely ~ AnAdmczyk 302 301 281 283 1572 77 +33w L3660 SincldGriMchsLgeyQckhn 3rd ovbad cvr o i3
BAUGS  1OYR 7 281 :58 1272 1:56 FMAOOOOCLM 15000 3 44h  44F 3% 1} on Cokely — AnAdmezyk 29 294 29 282 1:561 83 23y L5.90 Fiind Emdblky Dinngihi st upebuidld 2nd-8
oAy 4YR st 275 357116 1552 FMAOOOOCLM 15000 1 334 3% 32 4B 52 Cokely — AnAdmezyk 281 293 283 292 1:554 85 +14w  L*2.20 FrindDinnghihchsLgey 3hole.2nd 0w 10 bic8
13hug25  SYR B0 27 157 1:253 1:54¢ FMUNCLM 15000 6 79 9 7°7 53 3dhdk  CokKelly AnAdmezyk 292 292 281 282 1:552 91 +65w L1870 DefngthMNichsLgeyQckMn  Excess cur pace lane-8
SAu?5  OYR fst78° 974 571154 1-R42 FMA0OOOCIM 15000 8 g™  gM 76§75 g™ CoKelly  AnAdmezyk 30 292 273 293 1583 79 +67w L4950 DstniLowUBdRekFrind Satfrafc In.ang,no bid-8
?gw(ESIIB-)IsFS?sE HANOVER(L) ool Bame‘SDu%m"%snteoﬂe Veloclty, Aubergine Hanover by Somebeachsomewhere  Last 5 Sts-§12,300 1554 YR AR s 1) DA Doss ow
(| ht
-1 D. Dube 150454548 (0%) P. Paradis 53-6- 98 13) Br - Hanover Shoe Farms Inc,PA B «%B221 SH%Lfe B 6U12Z  §156
10c125  2YR fst6 D274 5741261 1.5 FM20000CLM 15000 7 ! 561 541‘2 32y 02% DaDube  PiParads 29 30 28 282 1:552 85 6w L3273 SaleElSolAnelseHnvGingrTilz Outginang In.even-8
N%p%  BYR fstﬁé!o 281 :5811:263 1:553 FM2000OCLM 15000 3 2‘5 %3 32 32 DaDube  PiParads 282 30 282 29! 156 82 12w L80! LinmpKnck Dismotil AnelseHny Pitang Inven-8
1Sepss YR fo74° 275 1571 1:95¢ 1644 FMOOOOCLM 15000 4 2% 23 22 2% 2% DaDube  PilParads 28 293 283 292 1:553 84 -18w  L971 DsiniLowAnelseHnuLinmpKnck Ldyld pkinobid8
4S5 QYR fSt72° 074 :5641252 164 FMOOOCLM 15000 3 454 4% 435 43F 3P DaDube  PiParads 284 29 28! 29 1555 88 +25v L4355 DsnilovDsmHAvisty andovdullov o7
Bhugs  BYR ISl 072 16631242 153 FMOOOICLM 15000 3 6% 553 B3k g6 47} DaDube  PilParads 282 281 282 30! 1:551 86 +54w L2850 UBORCKFghNFIGIBchBdy Took bk shfdno bid7
19Ag%5  9YR fst71o 271 :5611:251 1:56  FM20000CLM 15000 3 33? 33‘ 33 32} 41% DaDube PiParads 28 284 29 302 1:561 81 +54w  139.25 ThatsAHgBJiveDnengGrefiGl Shole 2nd ov stcy-8
13Aug%5  5YR s\yBOO 273 :57 1:253 1:544 FM20000CLM 15000 5 672 67$ 5? 64 744 DaDube PiJParads 29 292 281 29 1:553 88 +65w  L17.30 DinngthMMchsLgeyQckMn Qutgin frafc Inno bid-8
_1Aug2s g EJY'?'T If;;?;U_zljlw_l Iz_:sgaEéqlw_ sz;a FMINW5601 bL5 bm%oo 2 5 ‘ — 6? °7 68 67h Palachanc PiJParads 284 293 281 292 156 83 +1 zngR ;5‘3‘020 Tzvo;sﬂAan/ygggbzws - TookbMIhovgab\dJ
m 7, by Bettor's Delight, Ruthie J Killean by Daylon Frontier Last5Sts-§9,750  1:544YR ot24 245 930
41:51.4(58)Q 2247 24,00 Erc A Prevost Boynion Beach FL Fidder's Creek Siables LLC Neples L. 1:543 YR %g *% z g g Wzgff} -1333 22 zg 5 «§1125%
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5 YONKERS THU

1 Mile Pace. 3-6 YEAR OLD CLAIMING ALLOWANCE $20,000. Purse $15,000
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6 YONKERS THU 1 Mile Trot. CLAIMING ALLOWANCE $40,000. Purse $20,000
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