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12 YONKERS FRI

1 Mile Trot NW $5,000 IN LAST 5 STARTS. A WINNER IN THE BASE CLASS NW $5,000 L5 LAST START NE. AE: OPT. CLMG ALLOW $12,500. Purse $14,000

2ND HALF LATE DOUBLE | $2 EXACTA | $2 TRIPLE | $.10 SUPERFECTA

BE DIFFERENT

-1 A. Slegelman 1143-83- 125143(073)
268ep25 YRt fst74° 281 : 9 1:28 1:571 NW5000

19%ep25  6YRE fst77° 28 58 1:272 1:572 NW7500L5
13%ep25  9YRE fst76° 284 : 741:274 2:292 NW10874L5
5Sp2%5  6YRE fst78° 281 :58 1:271 1:564 NW10000
MAug25s  1YRE fst72° 28¢ :58112721552 NWW15000
15Aug25  7YRE fst82° 274 .57 1:254 1:552 NW10000
8Aug25 1YRE fst76° 28 :56¢1:253 1:553 NW10000

1Aug25  10YRE fst72° 283 :5811:263 1:56 NW15000

b g6, by Uncle Peter, Medusa Blue Chip by Credit Winner

51:55.3 (5/8) * $2,832 Jersey Shore Stables LLC Belmar NJ

P. Blumenfeld 360- 16 28- 38( 044)3‘
¥ 33 38

14000
16000
30000
19000
21000
19000
19000
21000

o — ~1O> ~1 oo W W

Br- Stonega te Stdbred Fms Inc,NJ
32%

TyButer PBlumnfld
DaDube PBlumnfld
DaWajrstn ~ PBlumnfld
MaMacDnld  PBlumnfld
BrHolland  PBlumnfld
BrHolland  PBlumnfld
BrHolland  PBlumnfld
GeBrennan _PBlumnfld

Last 5 Sts-$1,680

+6 6w
+6 5w
+4 5w
+6 4w
+15w
+4 9w
+2 6w
+15w

644 99599025 «34 644 +59%290
100 5900024 +38707 46774
000 -Life 132171018 $197921
8.45 HoleNHctr WildBIKIs BeDifernt Rode rail,even-7
832 PLOscrBIcKTBshiWndsngPnr 15t up,3w bof 3/4trd-8
89,07 MzopNPeFrWhinCetsthe 152wrai pst 1/2.empty-10
5260 VinyDeVie ShowMe MusclRide Traild rail no factr-8
28.00 CecilHnvBIyBoyHil StrMryMde Sat bk rai strugld-8
2240 OWThGrStrMryMdWrwWWhsor Rail 2w b 3/4,n0 bi-8
840 AqursFaceBDimtRdLb 3hole,2w bf 3/4,stdy-8
8.60 MsspStrmimAnAndvrHiTrckMr 2nd ov, st up,no bid-8

$BIG CHARLIE MORAN(L) Sg
obe

41:543 (1) Q $834

151 st, Sml(t 27292327(033)

2956025 14PcDf fSt76° 274 :5711:262 1

18Sep25  AYRE fst78° 282 582108 1

11Sep25  2Phlf fst79° 28 :56¢1:252 1:56 NWA000L4
6 1
03 2
1

1:262
1:2
1:2
4Sep5  6PhiE fst81° 28 :5711:26 1:561 NW2500
1:3
13
1:

:554 NW3500

2Thug?s  3MRE fst64° 31 1:0141:303 2:012 NAADA

3
0Aug?s  3MRE sly60° 304 1:018 1:311 2:011 NAADA

TAug?s  5YRE fst7€° 292 :5031:293 2:004 NAADA SUL7

BHJuyps  6M fst84° 272 :5611:p44 1:541 NW5000

:584 NAADAF L2

7,by Cantab Hall, Summers Windsong by RC Royalty
1tJ Arzano Colonia N
P. Fusco 50-3-4-4(. 060)

8000
13700
7500
6500
7500
7500
13100
10500

RPD~N—O0001Ts 2O

ANapolitn
JosphLee
JoAhle
DaMiller

MaDabruzz
MaDabruzz
MaDabruzz

JoAhle

Last 5 Sts-$4,170

Br.- Hanover Shoe Farms Inc,PA

PaFusco
PaFusco
PaFusco
PaFusco
PaFusco
PaFusco
PaFusco
PaFusco

25 YR
24 YR
2B YR

+3 4w
+5 3w
+5 8w

+6 1w

+3 6w
£ 4w
14w
+1 3w

21 $108825Tot 28 0 6 3 $23351

130
}g 013 $1414024Tot 38 5 3 6

$40.329
111 $15780Life 163161621  $181,152

1650 RvrOfDnle TonySpmo BigChrir Tek btw,gd try-8
1.3.19 BackstriPSwisHsOnfCretwntr Shfld.ang In,no bid-6
18.90 DarkMind LuckyWknd BigChriMr -8
L*1.90 SpyBooth BigChrMr ForeNAftr -8
L17.10 Psalmsfrt SrHralrsr BacksrtP Moved up p.7-8
110.30 BacksrtP BigChrlMr LottoHill -6
144,00 PpDc Criwnir tsniths 2w fuck 2nd tm,no bid-8

197.20 RocktMnHlVinyDeVieCrgbrn Took bkrai,no bid-10

¥SEVENSHADESOFGREY b g7, by Chapter Seven, Ms Naughty by Kadabra
61:542 (1) Q $1,504 Flalland Racino, Camobel Hall NY
R. Bucci 499-57-57-57(.114)

-1 Co. Kelly 494-63-81-72 (.128)

300125 11YRf fst66° 29 591 1:283 1:581 NW5000
%Sep2  1YRE fst74° 281 159 1:28 1:571 NW5000
195ep25  9YRE fst77° 284 15841 273 1:564 NW5000

6Sep25  3PcDE 0d66° 28 :5711:262 1:56 Amateur
23Aug2s  15MTE fst72° 282 :5741:271 1:55 NW7500

1HAuges _OM'E fst78° o NW7500
Thug?s  3YRE fst72° 283 15682127 1:571 NWBSS1LS
By 5YRE fst87° 274 562125 1:052 NW7500L5

14000
14000
14000
10000
12500
12500
16000
16000

CoKelly
CoKelly
JiMarhnJr

NeSheridn

JaCallghn

AuSiegmn

CoKelly

Last 5 Sts-$2,480
Br.- Concord Stud Farm LLC,NJ

RiBucci
RiBucci
RiBucci
RiBucci
RiBucci

RiBucci
RiBucci

BYR19 124 $313025Tot2 124 $3309
24YR26 416 $6530024 28526 573590
23 «30 444 $80900Life 149162021 »$49%6304

+1 6w
+6 6w
+6 5w
+0 5w
-1 5w
+6 7w
+15w
+1 6w

¥MUSCLE DAN(L)

8-1 J. Stratton 1982-198:206:203 143
30c25 1VDE fst73° 282 :5821:273
0%ep2%  5Stg  fst70° 282 :5841:082
28%p2%  11Stg fsté7° 282 :5821:
15%p25  10Stg fst74° 274 :5631
9 1
1
1.

1:56 Qua
1:593 NW2500
1:57 NWs000
1:57 NW5000

8Sep5  8Stg fste7° 29 1:

31Aug2s  3PcD fst74° 283 :573 1:

23Aug2s  9TgD fst81° 283 :583 1:

583 NW5000
57 Amateur

262 1:553 NW4501-4

MAug2s YR fst85° 274 573 1:272 1:563 NAADASULB

b g 6, by Dover Dan, Windsongm
61:56 }7/8)0$1 199 Joseph Cifetel Yorkiown Haiohts NY:Aloert CiuffeteliahopacNY
T. Ciuffetelli 16-1-4- 4 063

6300
9200
9200
9200
10000
9500
13100

usc\elady by Muscle Mass

TCiufftl
JaRandall
JoDerue
JoDerue
JoDerue
TCufftl
TCiufftl
TCiufftl

Last 5 Sts-$1,104
Br.- M Lehman & O Bontrager & J Lengacher Jr,IN;e

TCiufftl
TCiufftl
TCiufftl
TCiufftl
TCiufftl
TCiufftll
TCiufftl
TCiufftl

24

+6 2w

2.25 PrincArch Fanatic Sevnshdsf Pkt.ang In trot-8
16.70 HoleNHetrWildBIKIsBeDifernt st tum brkno bi-7
4,34 NoDrmPIsHINHetrWidBIKIs 2w,1st up,stalldrd-8
4,80 BigLimoMasveMatr MamyWata Unc chase,trd-7
23.20 SprDprCorArdsPeakNLukesBar 1st up stalld,trd-10
-7

2,85 DwsPntManMycrownmyFIiScl Speed, st tum brk-8
24.25 AqursFace FulOfscl HanknsHnv Brk bef start-8
BYR 8043 $197%6725Tot25 154 $2997%6
6113 $1536924Tot 27 2 4 4  $25061
23325 $0210Life 132122023 $201285
Lnb MuscleDan HpRunDict UltimFtsy 4
L17.13 TobemJesesDol TownBmch -8
14.28 ScrtOrNot ComnvrHnv TownBmch Dg,p.7-8
1854 ConqustAs NinlLveAs MuscleDan -8
L2497 Missile ReelBusy CheryMasn -8
1240 lisnfthse Gatsby BigNudge Extend break-7
169.50 PChico AndovrCnt DominnDay 9

+0 3w

1.19.40 RgnOfHnrMscIDnSwsHsOnf Ld,ovrtkn pst 3/4,trd-8

fWINDSONG PIONEER(L) bg9, by ELTitan, Early Secret by Ear\

4153.2(5/8) Q $1,845 Thomas Ceraso Jr Stamford CT

P. Stafford 362-38- 48 -39 105)
125 12}

9-2 J. Marohn,Jr. 75196102077

265ep2% 3YR¢ fst74° 28 :5711:253 1:552 NW5721L5 14000
195p%  6YRE fst77° 28 :58 1:272 1:572 NW7500L5 16000
5%p2%  4YRE fst78° 284 :5811:2711:56 NW11086L5 19000
2Aug?5  9YRE Tst79° 284 :57¢1:27 1:563 NW15000 21000
14Aug2s  BYRE fst85° 274 1564 1:054 1:553 nw20000L 25000
TAug?5 _4YRt fst76° 282 :5741:262 1:551 NW203BIL5 25000
7Juy25  7YRE fst88° 274 :5741:07 1:564 NW22551L5 25000
11Juy25  11YRE fst8O° 28 574197 {571 NW1131L5 21000

PO oOOo1T—00 0 —O1

JiMarhnJr
JiMarhnJr
JiMarhnJr
JiMarhnJr
JiMarhnJr
BrHolland
BrHolland

Palachanc

Last 5 Sts-$4,850
Br- Wl\l\am H Loyens-Paulette C Loyens,London,On

PaStaffrd
PaStaffrd
PaStaffrd
PaStaffrd
PaStaffrd
PaStaffrd
PaStaffrd
PaStaffrd

25

«25 244 $631025Tot 26 2 4 4 WS47,960

24YR31 565 $7238024Tot 31 5 6 5 572380
BYR3I 462 §HLife 202332923 .$43213%6

+6 6w
+6 5w
+6 4w
+5 4w
+0 3w
1 dw

16.01 WiweWhsprkshVWndsngPor Ld,dug inovrtkn In-7

L7.78 PLOscrBIckTBshWndsngPnr Sat,2w bf 3/4n0 bid-8
137.20 ImgmtAmSStriGspThThngls Off pacerai no bic-7
L47.25 AqursFaceTorroneDwsPnthn Traild 5th ov,no fetr-8
157.00 MsspiStrm Chulo OverNBack Yid pkt.empty-8
149.75 DribingBiTheHaz!tnBronzer Off pace,rail,no bid-7
16025 BlackhwkZCactstthcDrwThelLne Traild railno factr-7
12575 TachyonCrazylandUnevrgngt Shild,ang In,no bid-7

SHOW THE WILL(L)

Ty. Buter 443-56- 469 (120

b g6, by Possess The WlH Stage Show by Broadway Hall

61:54.2 (5/8) $1,423 Esirada Racing LLC Cranbuny NJ

I. Estrada 213-20- 32 24(
82

265ep25 4YR  fstr4> 274 57312641564 NW7500L5 16000
19%p2  BYR fst77° 28 58 1:272 1:572 NWT500L5 16000
11Sep25  OPhl fst79° 282 57212531542 NW7500L4 9500
4Se0% _ OPhl fstB1° 281 57412621553 NW7500L4 9500
14Aug2s ~ 7Blv fstBO° 283 :59 1:282 1:571 NW5250L4 9700
6Aug25  4Btv fst8O° g4 57312721583 nwes0L4 7200
0y 138ty Fste4° 302100 1:293 1:593 nw2250L4 7200
16Juy25  4BR fst85° 291 :58 10811574 nu250L4 8800

ODhN— OO ~O1T

Br.- Fashion Farms LLC,PA
) 5

TyButer
CoKelly
TrBeyer
DaMiller
JiMrrlldr
JiMrelldr

CROWN MONARCH(L)
7-2 J. Bartlett 1284-421-227-176 (.328)

b h 4, by Father Patrick, Muscle Babe by Muscle Mass

31:54.1 (5/8) $965 Enablor Stable LLC Wriohistown NJ;Tomas Andersson Nossebro.SD

P. Engblom 929- 206 150 119( 222)4
34

Br.- K|e\| Magne Andersen,SZ
533

CoKelly
CoKelly
CoKelly
CoKelly
SiAllard
TiTetrick

AnMcCrthy

DaMiller

Last 5 Sts-$4,980

|Estrada
|Estrada
|Estrada
[Estrada

ShMedongh
ShMcdongh
ShMcdongh  ShMcdongh

%BYR 2000 $208025 .30 4 5 4  $426%

MaKakaley ShMcdongh
Last 5 Sts-$3,120

PeEngblom
PeEngblom
PeEngblom
PeEngblom
PeEngblom
PeEngblom
PeEngblom
PeEngblom

24YR 0000 -24Tot40 2 55  $28666
BYRO0O0DOO -Life 134122017  $122970
+6 6w L28.59 ImAnAndviPremiVeiEnrgysic Sat bk,ang In stdy-8
+6 5w 128.38 PLOsCrBICKTBshWndsngPrr Cur 4w bf 3/4.n0 bid-8
+58w  L10.00 Ricardo Sainthood WhitShHnv -8
+6 11w L18.30 Howingihm WhitShHnv LuckyWknd 8
19.80 BigBIrBne ShwTheWil GoodBoy -8
11.50 StwTheWil WorhAWhs MrColSyre -8
154.25 SkywayPrf Fashinken OurNghtFr -8
14,80 Latavius Sentrprse FashinKen -8
BYR 5000 $417025Tot 21 1 3 2 S0265
24YR 3010 $811024Tot 21 3 2 1 $70233
ZBYRO0O0O0O -Life 50 6 5 3  $137562
+66w L3877 WiweWhspriashaVWndsngPnr Rode railno bid-7
+65w  L16.31 NoDmPIsHoleNHetrWildBIKIs Took bk railno bid-8
+15w  L14.20 MusclRide Wania NoDrmPls Rode railno bid-7
+5 50 L45.40 ChefRocco EposOstrv TuisAngel Toured the track-8
+8 8w L15.80 InATnyWay Wania Crwnnrch Yldpkt wkna-8
+450  L*.30 CrwnMnrch GreenZone TmyMcknze -8
+0 3w L*1.40 DinkyWnky Fursiigor Shwmyrgns 7
+0 6w L6.30 DarkMind ForeNAfr ImaStndoG

brg 9, by RC Royalty, Cruella De Ville by Yankee Glide
Schnittker, Middletown,NY
R. Schnittker 154- 14116 1

%%p25 YR fst74° 28 :5711:253 1:552 NW5T21L5 14000
195025 _OYR fst77° 284 :58¢1:073 1:564 NW5000 14000
MAug5 YR fst72° 284 :5841:28 1:572 NW5000 14000
19Aug25  4PcD fst76° 273 :5731:06 1:543 NW4500 8500
12Aug25  13PcD fst92° 271 :5711:251 1:541 NWA400L4 8500
24 Juy25  4Phl fstB4° 28 :5841:273 1:573 NW1250 6000
17Juy25  2Phl fst89° 28 58 1:061 1:554 NW2500 6500
3July25  13Phl fstB6° 273 572196 1:553 NWA000L4 7500
FFULL RIGHTS
1:55.3 Q $614 Raymond
20-1 Ma. MacDonald 393-16-27- 40(041)
%525 1YRE fst74° 281 59 1:28 1:571 NW5000 14000
19Sep25  OYRE fst77° 284 :58412731 564 NW5000 14000
5%p2%  BYRE fst78° 272 :5611:26 1:562 NWA000 14000
NAugs  1YRE fst72° 28¢ ‘58H28 1:56 Qua T/P

18 Julv25 fst8o° Co NW5000

6July?5 1Gost gdee° 291 ‘5921:2841:574 HallOfFame
6Jin25  2YRE fst77° 281 :56¢1:251 1:552 NWA431L5
30Mays  4YRE fst66° 292 :5031:981 1:573 nwb01Ld

14000

14000
14000

Br- Runthetab\e Stables,NJ

44 MaMacDnld
Palachanc
MaMacDnld
MaMacDnld

TiTetrick

MaMacDnld
MaMacDnld

Last 5 Sts-$1,120

RSchnttkr
RSchnttkr
RSchnttkr
RSchnttkr

RSchnitkr
RSchnttkr
RSchnttkr

308 30 285 308 1.5+ 65
294 28% 284 304 158 T3
293 301 283 302 1:584

%YR18 020 $1106025Tot 18 0 2 0 $11EI50
4YR32 323 $4781024Tot 34 3 3 3 $504%%
BZYR2 233 $39700Life 193202024 $365217

+6 6w
+6 5w
+6 4w

+23w

+5 5w
+2 50

23.35 HoleNHcirWildBIKIsBDfrt Satang Ist tmno big-7
37.84 NDmPISHINHctrWidBIKls Sat bk bad cvr,no bid-8
35.00 EnrgyKingSthArrWrwiWhspr Off pace,cvr,no bid-7
nb Colctvirk WistraBlc FulRights 5

-7

nb ReelEminhrrknsipt LukesBar 8
52.75 PasntPrmsPcFreWWhinSwisHsOnf Traild railno fact-6
47.25 HINHetrPsniPrmsRNMrcy Bad cvr, 3w bf 34 stdy-8

(L) TREATED WITH LASIX



